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We love them with all our hearts, but do we really know where our dogs came from? Kim Kavin,
author of Little Boy Blue, reveals the complex network behind the $11 billion-a-year business of selling
dogs. A must-read for the benefit of all dogs, everywhere.

In what promises to become an "Omnivore's Dilemma" for dog lovers--breed devotees and adoption
advocates alike--The Dog Merchants is the first book to explain the complex and often surprisingly similar
business practices that extend from the American Kennel Club to local shelters, from Westminster
champions to dog auctions.

Without judging dog lovers of any stripe, The Dog Merchants makes it clear that money spent among these
dog merchants has real-world effects on people and canines. Kavin reveals how dog merchants create
markets for dogs, often in defiance of the usual rules of supply and demand. She takes an investigative
approach and meets breeders and rescuers at all levels, shedding much-needed light on an industry that most
people don't even realize is an industry.

Kavin’s goal is to advance the conversation about how all dogs are treated, from puppy mills to high-kill
shelters. She shows that a great deal can be improved by understanding the business practices behind selling
dogs of all kinds. Instead of pitting rescue and purebred people against each other, The Dog Merchants
shows how all dog lovers can come together, with one voice as consumers, on behalf of all our beloved
companions.
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From reader reviews:

Eunice Bourque:

Now a day folks who Living in the era where everything reachable by match the internet and the resources
included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each details they get. How many people to be smart
in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information mainly this The Dog Merchants: Inside the Big
Business of Breeders, Pet Stores, and Rescuers book because book offers you rich information and
knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already
know.

Aimee Nguyen:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic
inside park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different
to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book can be option to fill your cost-free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to
try out look for book, may be the reserve untitled The Dog Merchants: Inside the Big Business of Breeders,
Pet Stores, and Rescuers can be excellent book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Erica Futch:

The book The Dog Merchants: Inside the Big Business of Breeders, Pet Stores, and Rescuers has a lot of
information on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was
written by the very famous author. Tom makes some research prior to write this book. This kind of book
very easy to read you will get the point easily after reading this article book.

Allison Larson:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-book
means, more simple and reachable. That The Dog Merchants: Inside the Big Business of Breeders, Pet
Stores, and Rescuers can give you a lot of pals because by you investigating this one book you have factor
that they don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step
for you to get success. This e-book offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't learn, by knowing
more than additional make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? We need to have The Dog Merchants:
Inside the Big Business of Breeders, Pet Stores, and Rescuers.
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