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From the end of Reconstruction through World War II, a network of public colleges for white women
flourished throughout the South. Founded primarily as vocational colleges to educate women of modest
economic means for life in the emerging “new” South, these schools soon transformed themselves into
comprehensive liberal arts–industrial institutions, proving so popular that they became among the largest
women’s colleges in the nation. In this illuminating volume, David Gold and Catherine L. Hobbs examine
rhetorical education at all eight of these colleges, providing a better understanding of not only how women
learned to read, write, and speak in American colleges but also how they used their education in their lives
beyond college.

With a collective enrollment and impact rivaling that of the Seven Sisters, the schools examined in this
study—Mississippi State College for Women (1884), Georgia State College for Women (1889), North
Carolina College for Women (1891), Winthrop College in South Carolina (1891), Alabama College for
Women (1896), Texas State College for Women (1901), Florida State College for Women (1905), and
Oklahoma College for Women (1908)—served as important centers of women’s education in their states,
together educating over a hundred thousand students before World War II and contributing to an emerging
professional class of women in the South. After tracing the establishment and evolution of these institutions,
Gold and Hobbs explore education in speech arts and public speaking at the colleges and discuss writing
instruction, setting faculty and departmental goals and methods against larger institutional, professional, and
cultural contexts. In addition to covering the various ways the public women’s colleges prepared women to
succeed in available occupations, the authors also consider how women’s education in rhetoric and writing
affected their career choices, the role of race at these schools, and the legacy of public women’s colleges in
relation to the history of women’s education and contemporary challenges in the teaching of rhetoric and
writing.

The experiences of students and educators at these institutions speak to important conversations among
scholars in rhetoric, education, women’s studies, and history. By examining these previously unexplored but
important institutional sites, Educating the New Southern Woman provides a richer and more complex
history of women’s rhetorical education and experiences.
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From reader reviews:

Patrina Eaton:

In other case, little individuals like to read book Educating the New Southern Woman: Speech, Writing, and
Race at the Public Women's Colleges, 1884-1945 (Studies in Rhetorics and Feminisms). You can choose the
best book if you love reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a new book Educating the
New Southern Woman: Speech, Writing, and Race at the Public Women's Colleges, 1884-1945 (Studies in
Rhetorics and Feminisms). You can add information and of course you can around the world by the book.
Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can realize everything! From your country right up until
foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you are able to
know that. In this era, you can open a book or perhaps searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You
can use it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's examine.

Robert Young:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can easily share their
idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their particular reader with
their story or maybe their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the guides. But also they write
about the information about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or
how to teach your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors in this
world always try to improve their ability in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write on their
book. One of them is this Educating the New Southern Woman: Speech, Writing, and Race at the Public
Women's Colleges, 1884-1945 (Studies in Rhetorics and Feminisms).

Jennifer Pittman:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just
watching TV, or playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different
you can read the book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent the
entire day to reading a e-book. The book Educating the New Southern Woman: Speech, Writing, and Race at
the Public Women's Colleges, 1884-1945 (Studies in Rhetorics and Feminisms) it is quite good to read.
There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. If you
did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore easily to
read this book from your smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book has high quality.

Amber Tyson:

E-book is one of source of understanding. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but in



addition native or citizen need book to know the up-date information of year to be able to year. As we know
those ebooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the
world. By book Educating the New Southern Woman: Speech, Writing, and Race at the Public Women's
Colleges, 1884-1945 (Studies in Rhetorics and Feminisms) we can take more advantage. Don't you to be
creative people? Being creative person must choose to read a book. Just choose the best book that
appropriate with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life at this time book Educating the New
Southern Woman: Speech, Writing, and Race at the Public Women's Colleges, 1884-1945 (Studies in
Rhetorics and Feminisms). You can more desirable than now.
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