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Praise for author David B. Williams:

 

“Makes stones sing” --Kirkus Reviews
“Williams’s lively mixture of hard science and piquant lore is sure to fire the readers’ curiosity”
--Publisher’s Weekly

*Part history, part folklore, part geology
* Features charming black-and-white illustrations

From meadow trails to airy mountaintops and wide open desert, cairns -- those seemingly random stacks of
rocks -- are surprisingly rich in stories and meaning. For thousands of years cairns have been used by people
to connect to the landscape and communicate with others, and are often an essential guide to travelers.
Cairns, manmade rock piles can indicate a trail, mark a grave, serve as an altar or shrine, reveal property
boundaries or sacred hunting grounds, and even predict astronomical activity. The Inuit have more than two
dozen terms to describe cairns and their uses!

In Cairns: Messengers in Stone, geologist and acclaimed nature writer David B. Williams (Stories in Stone:
Travels through Urban Geology) explores the history of cairns from the moors of Scotland to the peaks of
the Himalaya -- where they come from, what they mean, why they’re used, how to make cairns, and more.
Cairns are so much more than a random pile of rocks, knowing how to make cairns can drastically alter the
meaning of the formation. Hikers, climbers, travelers, gardeners, and nature buffs alike will delight in this
quirky, captivating collection of stories about cairns.
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From reader reviews:

Evelyn Garcia:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to know everything in the world. Each book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that e-book
has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are really reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, person feel need book whenever they found difficult problem as well as exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this Cairns: Messengers in Stone.

Michelle Wilson:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that
they don't want do that. You must know how great along with important the book Cairns: Messengers in
Stone. All type of book are you able to see on many sources. You can look for the internet sources or other
social media.

Joyce Lynch:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different
content. As you may know that book is very important for us. The book Cairns: Messengers in Stone seemed
to be making you to know about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It is very
advantages for you. The book Cairns: Messengers in Stone is not only giving you far more new information
but also being your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your book.
Try to make relationship together with the book Cairns: Messengers in Stone. You never experience lose out
for everything when you read some books.

Eric Saunders:

Some individuals said that they feel weary when they reading a guide. They are directly felt that when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the actual book Cairns: Messengers in Stone to make your
personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading skill is developing when you just like reading.
Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the sensation about book and reading
especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to available a book and go through it. Beside that the reserve
Cairns: Messengers in Stone can to be your friend when you're feel alone and confuse with the information
must you're doing of their time.
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