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Over 110 practical recipes to explore the vast array of statistics in Minitab 17

About This Book

Gain an in-depth understanding of data formatting in Minitab●

Understand the steps required to generate great results with tools like regression, ANOVA, and●

multivariate statistics
Useful and practical recipes that cover examples from a broad range of topics in Minitab●

Who This Book Is For

This book is great for anyone who is familiar with statistics and who wants to learn how Minitab works.
Whilst you do not need to be an expert in all areas of statistics, you should understand the basics of the
chapters you are interested in.

What You Will Learn

Import data successfully into Minitab from Excel●

Explore the options for generating amazing charts●

Investigate differences between samples with inferential statistics●

Find the significant relationships in data by analyzing variance and using regression●

Work with control charts to view process variation●

Learn about Capability Analysis in Minitab for both normal and non normal data●

Find trends and seasonality in your data●

Apply Multivariate statistics to observe patterns and relationships across many variables●

Automate tasks using the Minitab Macro language●

Use Gage studies and MSA's to investigate measurement systems●

In Detail

Minitab has been a statistical package of choice across all numerous sectors of industry including education
and finance. Correctly using Minitab's statistical tools is an essential part of good decision making and
allows you to achieve your targeted results, while displaying fantastic charts and a powerful analysis will
also communicate your results more effectively.

"Minitab Cookbook" will take the mystery out of using Minitab and will simplify the steps to produce great
results. This book will be hugely beneficial for anyone who knows what statistics or studies they want to run,
but who is unsure about just what button to press or what option to select.



In this book, you will learn how to use data from different sources and will be guided through the basics of
graphs as well as the basics of hypothesis tests. You will explore the use of non-linear regression, how to
construct complex ANOVAs, and even delve into Multivariate statistics.

"Minitab Cookbook" is a great reference on how to create graphs, generate P-values, and how to put data in
order. You will explore the basics of charts as well as into the complex depths of Factor analysis, and you
will learn everything from the simplest of t-tests to the complexity of mixed model ANOVA. And finally, for
all of you who want to write Macros, this book covers the use of Execs, Global, and Local Macros.
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From reader reviews:

Earnestine Marcus:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading habit give
you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book
that will improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of reserve you read,
if you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want sense happy read one using
theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual Minitab Cookbook is kind of publication
which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Austin Lawrence:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information currently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is within the former life are difficult to be find than now could be
taking seriously which one would work to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you find
the unstable resource then you have it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Minitab Cookbook as your daily resource
information.

Jordan Sena:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Aim
to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't assess book by its cover may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside
appearance likes. Maybe you answer may be Minitab Cookbook why because the amazing cover that make
you consider regarding the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content will be fantastic as the
outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Romana Linder:

This Minitab Cookbook is new way for you who has fascination to look for some information since it relief
your hunger details. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still
having bit of digest in reading this Minitab Cookbook can be the light food in your case because the
information inside this specific book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books produce itself in the form
which can be reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in
guide form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a
publication especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for an individual. So ,
don't miss this! Just read this e-book style for your better life in addition to knowledge.
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