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Reveals the secret language and words of power that enabled the ancient Egyptians to imagine the world into
existence

• Reveals ancient Egyptian Mystery teachings on immaculate conception, transubstantiation, resurrection,
and eternal life

• Explores the shamanic journeys that ancient Egyptian priests used to view the unconscious and the afterlife

• Provides the essential spiritual tools needed to return to Zep Tepi, the creative source

Drawing from the Egyptian Book of the Dead, the Pyramid texts, the Book of Thoth, and other sacred
hieroglyphic writings spanning the three millennia of the Egyptian Mystery Traditions, Normandi Ellis
reveals the magical language of creation and words of power that enabled the ancient Egyptians to act as co-
creators with the gods.

Examining the power of hieroglyphic thinking--how thoughts create reality--and the multiple meanings
behind every word of power, the author shows how, with the Neteru, we imagine the world into existence,
casting a spell of consciousness over the material world. Uncovering the deep layers of meaning and symbol
within the myths of the Egyptian gods and goddesses, Ellis investigates the shamanic journeys that ancient
Egyptian priests used to view the unconscious and the afterlife and shares their initiations for immaculate
conception, transubstantiation, resurrection, and eternal life—initiations that later became part of the
Christian mystery school. Revealing the words of power used by these ancient priests/sorcerers, she explains
how to search for the deeper, hidden truths beneath their spells and shows how ancient Egyptian
consciousness holds the secret of life itself.

Revealing the initiatory secrets of the Osirian Mystery school, Ellis provides the essential teachings and
shamanic tools needed to return to Zep Tepi--the creative source--as we face the transitional time of radical
change currently at hand.
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From reader reviews:

Kathleen Edwards:

This book untitled Imagining the World into Existence: An Ancient Egyptian Manual of Consciousness to be
one of several books which best seller in this year, here is because when you read this publication you can
get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy that book in the book shop or you can order it through online.
The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can
read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason for you to past this publication from your list.

Gregory Morrow:

The e-book with title Imagining the World into Existence: An Ancient Egyptian Manual of Consciousness
has a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This particular
book exist new information the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world at
this point. That is important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This particular book
will bring you with new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you
can read that anywhere you want.

Adriana Phillips:

On this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple solution to have that.
What you have to do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to possess a look at some books.
One of the books in the top record in your reading list is actually Imagining the World into Existence: An
Ancient Egyptian Manual of Consciousness. This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Hills can get
you closer in becoming precious person. By looking up and review this book you can get many advantages.

Joann Nixon:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source this filled update of news. With this
modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social like
newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just in search of the
Imagining the World into Existence: An Ancient Egyptian Manual of Consciousness when you desired it?
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