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After the brilliant success of his last series of London Symphonies, Haydn went home to Vienna, recognized
throughout Europe as the supreme master of both the symphony and the quartet; but his career was not yet
over and the great master, now approaching seventy, responded to the accolades with a final burst of creative
energy. Inspired by performances of Handel he had seen in London, Haydn concentrated his talents in the
genre of oratorios and masses, providing us with a marvelous coda to a prolific career; his final masterpiece,
The Seasons, completed in his sixty-ninth year.
Grove's Dictionary states that Haydn "put much of his greatest music into his oratorios" and this is quite
evident in the bold, inventive quality of The Seasons. It is filled with a fresh feeling of innovation that can be
attributed not only to what he had learned in London but also to the lasting influence of his great friend
Mozart. The engaging melodies of the chorus and soloist are never overpowered by the orchestrations but
are, instead, delightfully supported by a score that balances expression with refinement like none before.
Based on an adaptation of a popular nature poem by James Thomson, the text, though secular in subject
matter, expresses a reverence for nature perfectly suited for the oratorio form. It was adapted and translated
by Gottfried van Swieten, who also collaborated on Haydn's previous oratorio, The Creation. Today The
Seasons remains a remarkably dramatic work that musicians and scholars turn to again and again.
This volume, reproduced from the authoritative C. F. Peters edition, is complete, with the most often
performed English translation running directly beneath the German text in the score. Both singers and
instrumentalists will find it an inexpensive and invaluable addition to their libraries; and music scholars will
delight in this high-quality reproduction of the final statement from an influential genius.
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From reader reviews:

Joyce McDonald:

Reading a book to become new life style in this season; every people loves to read a book. When you read a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, as well as soon.
The The Seasons in Full Score will give you a new experience in reading through a book.

Daniel Rhoads:

In this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more treasured
than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you
have to do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of many
books in the top listing in your reading list will be The Seasons in Full Score. This book which can be
qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking upward and
review this e-book you can get many advantages.

James Walton:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the most
effective book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is identified as of
book The Seasons in Full Score. You can include your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it
can add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about
guide. It can bring you from one place to other place.

Karolyn Kaufman:

E-book is one of source of understanding. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen will need book to know the update information of year in order to year. As we
know those ebooks have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to
around the world. From the book The Seasons in Full Score we can get more advantage. Don't you to
definitely be creative people? Being creative person must like to read a book. Merely choose the best book
that acceptable with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life at this book The Seasons in Full
Score. You can more inviting than now.
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