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A charming story about the joys of reading that is perfect for fans of Dog Loves Books and Stellaluna.

Duncan the Dragon loves to read. When he reads a story, his imagination catches fire! Unfortunately . . . so
does his book.
 
Fire breath is great for roasting marshmallows, but it’s not so great for reading. Duncan just wants to get to
those two wonderful words, like the last sip of a chocolate milk shake: The End. Will he ever find out how
the story ends?
 
This bright, warm tale champions determination, friendship, and a love for books. And milk shakes!

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Donald Gullett:

The book Duncan the Story Dragon give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to
make your capable a lot more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting pressure or having
big problem together with your subject. If you can make reading a book Duncan the Story Dragon for being
your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about a number of
or all subjects. You may know everything if you like open and read a reserve Duncan the Story Dragon.
Kinds of book are several. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think
about this reserve?

Ross Fletcher:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be up-date about what going on or information even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era which is always change and advance. Some of you
maybe will probably update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you but the problems
coming to an individual is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Duncan the Story Dragon is
our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and wish
in this era.

Evelyn Nay:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading behavior give you
lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book in
which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of guide you read,
if you want drive more knowledge just go with education books but if you want truly feel happy read one
using theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Often the Duncan the Story Dragon is kind of book
which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Mary Linkous:

Often the book Duncan the Story Dragon has a lot of information on it. So when you make sure to read this
book you can get a lot of profit. The book was published by the very famous author. This articles author
makes some research previous to write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can obtain the
point easily after reading this book.
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