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The challenges smart and creative people encounter—from scientific researchers, genius award winners, to
bestselling novelists, Broadway actors, high-powered attorneys, and academics— often include anxiety,
over-thinking, mania, sadness, and despair.

Specifically, Dr. Maisel examines:

“racing brain syndrome”●

living in an anti-intellectual culture●

finding ideas worth loving●

dealing with boredom and hypersensitivity●

finding meaning in their lives and their work●

struggling to achieve success●

In Why Smart People Hurt, psychologist Dr. Eric Maisel draws on his many years of work with the best and
the brightest to pinpoint these often devastating challenges and offer solutions based on the groundbreaking
principles and practices of natural psychology.

His thoughtful strategies include using logic and creativity to cope with the problems of having a brain that
goes into overdrive at the drop of a hat. With a series of questions at the end of each chapter, he guides the
reader to create his or her own roadmap to a calm and meaningful life.

Why Smart People Hurt is a must-read for parents of gifted children as well as the millions of smart and
creative people that are searching for a more meaningful life. 

For more information please visit: www.whysmartpeoplehurt.com
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From reader reviews:

Ana Gaskill:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to understand everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or even goal; it means that
book has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They can be
reading whatever they get because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Why not the person who don't
like reading a book? Sometime, person feel need book when they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will need this Why Smart People Hurt: A Guide for the Bright, the Sensitive, and the Creative.

Antonio Nelson:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this Why Smart People Hurt: A Guide for the
Bright, the Sensitive, and the Creative e-book written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make
book which might be understand by anyone who read the book. Written inside good manner for you,
dripping every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still uncertainty Why Smart
People Hurt: A Guide for the Bright, the Sensitive, and the Creative as good book but not only by the cover
but also through the content. This is one guide that can break don't evaluate book by its protect, so do you
still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already
told you so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Kimberly Duda:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every
year has been exactly added. This book Why Smart People Hurt: A Guide for the Bright, the Sensitive, and
the Creative was filled regarding science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your research
competence. Some people has different feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big advantage
of a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book
you wanted.

Sandra Fritz:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the best
book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is named of book Why
Smart People Hurt: A Guide for the Bright, the Sensitive, and the Creative. You can add your knowledge by
it. Without leaving the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It
is most significant that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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