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On a warm afternoon in the autumn of 1860 the best, or rather the only, inn of Sestri-Ponente was full of
people. Firpo, the host of the Albergo e Trattoria della Grotta, was little accustomed to such a crowd, except
on Sundays and fête-days. As this was only a simple Thursday, his sunburnt cheeks reflected a smile of
satisfaction. Sestri-Ponente is situated an hour’s distance from Genoa, on the sea-shore "in vincinanza del
mare" and on the grand route from Savona to Nice. Sestri, beside dock-yards for the construction of small
merchant-vessels, which is its chief source of wealth, possesses also a fine beach where it is possible to bathe
in safety. It has this one superiority over Genoa "la superba" which lacks sea-bathing. Genoa has all else;
even her trees seem dwarfed near her stately edifices; she has a magnificent harbour, and if one is determined
to bathe in the sea he can hire a boat to take him some distance from the quay, where the water is not full of
all sorts of débris. Once in clear water a rope is tied around his waist, and he can seat himself on the steps
fixed to the back of the boat. If he slip, the honest boatman draws him out of the sea, by the rope, at the end
of which he looks like a new species of fish suspended on a hook. Those who dislike this method are at
liberty to bathe in the saltwater of the port or in the marble bath-houses of the Piazza Sarzana; but to bathe
where the beach is more or less rocky one must abandon Genoa for the fashionable Livourne, the charming
Spezia, or the modest Sestri. The wealthier classes congregate at the former resorts.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Battle:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important for all of us. The book The Jew has been making you to know about
other expertise and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The reserve The
Jew is not only giving you considerably more new information but also to get your friend when you feel
bored. You can spend your spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship with all the book The
Jew. You never feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

Terry Snider:

Now a day people that Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by connect with the internet and
the resources within it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each facts they get. How a lot more to
be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information especially this The Jew book as this book offers you
rich facts and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you
probably know this.

Gregory Medina:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information presently can get by anyone on everywhere.
The information can be a information or any news even an issue. What people must be consider if those
information which is inside former life are hard to be find than now's taking seriously which one is suitable
to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource then you get
it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will not happen
with you if you take The Jew as your daily resource information.

Yolanda Powers:

You could spend your free time to study this book this guide. This The Jew is simple to bring you can read it
in the park your car, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not possess much space to bring often the
printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save often the book
in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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