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Introduction to Hydraulics for Industry Professionals is a learning package for students or professionals who
are looking to build their fluid power careers. The package includes a colored textbook, an interactive
software-based tool to size hydraulic components, electronic files for the animated hydraulic circuits, and
a colored workbook (separate price) that contains printed power point slides, chapter reviews and
assignments. The book is the first in a series that the author plans to publish to offer complete and
comprehensive teaching and design tools for the fluid power industry. This book is an attempt to fill the gap
between the very academic style of fluid power books and the very commercial style of books that are
produced by fluid power manufacturers. The book presents the equations in both the Metric and English
systems of units. The book considers presenting real-life examples for Mobile and Industrial applications.
The book goes above and beyond the fundamental level of fluid power. This book covers the construction
and operating principles of the hydraulic components, using the right terminologies. Topics covered include:
determination of proper specifications of hydraulic components, how to perform the required calculations to
size a hydraulic component, how to read hydraulic schematic diagrams, how to predict pump efficiency
under specific operating conditions, how to draw the power distribution for the duty cycle of a machine, how
to investigate the losses in a hydraulic system, a presentation of different concepts for building hydraulic
circuits, and much more.  The textbook is produced in letter size (8.5 x 11) inches, weighs 3.5 lb, and
contains a total of eight chapters. The workbook is produced in the same size and weighs 1 lb. The associated
software is online downloadable.
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From reader reviews:

Cameron Trammell:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As we know that
book is very important for all of us. The book Introduction to Hydraulics for Industry Professionals:
Hydraulic Systems Volume 1 has been making you to know about other information and of course you can
take more information. It is very advantages for you. The book Introduction to Hydraulics for Industry
Professionals: Hydraulic Systems Volume 1 is not only giving you a lot more new information but also being
your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your guide. Try to make
relationship together with the book Introduction to Hydraulics for Industry Professionals: Hydraulic Systems
Volume 1. You never feel lose out for everything when you read some books.

Therese McGaha:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This
reading addiction give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge even the
information inside the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The information you get
based on what kind of book you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if
you want experience happy read one using theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The actual
Introduction to Hydraulics for Industry Professionals: Hydraulic Systems Volume 1 is kind of publication
which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

James Goodman:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information these days can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even an issue. What people must be
consider when those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you obtain
the unstable resource then you have it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Introduction to Hydraulics for Industry
Professionals: Hydraulic Systems Volume 1 as your daily resource information.

Kathy Fredette:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Introduction to Hydraulics for Industry
Professionals: Hydraulic Systems Volume 1 can be the respond to, oh how comes? It's a book you know.
You are consequently out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this completely new era is common
not a nerd activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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