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Beginning in the late eighteenth century, huge circular panoramas presented their audiences with resplendent
representations that ranged from historic battles to exotic locations. Such panoramas were immersive but
static. There were other panoramas that moved--hundreds, and probably thousands of them. Their history has
been largely forgotten. In Illusions in Motion, Erkki Huhtamo excavates this neglected early manifestation of
media culture in the making. The moving panorama was a long painting that unscrolled behind a "window"
by means of a mechanical cranking system, accompanied by a lecture, music, and sometimes sound and light
effects. Showmen exhibited such panoramas in venues that ranged from opera houses to church halls,
creating a market for mediated realities in both city and country. In the first history of this phenomenon,
Huhtamo analyzes the moving panorama in all its complexity, investigating its relationship to other media
and its role in the culture of its time. In his telling, the panorama becomes a window for observing media in
operation. Huhtamo explores such topics as cultural forms that anticipated the moving panorama; theatrical
panoramas; the diorama; the "panoramania" of the 1850s and the career of Albert Smith, the most successful
showman of that era; competition with magic lantern shows; the final flowering of the panorama in the late
nineteenth century; and the panorama's afterlife as a topos, traced through its evocation in literature,
journalism, science, philosophy, and propaganda."Beneath the Surface" with Jon Wiener
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From reader reviews:

Gerald Hackler:

Here thing why this kind of Illusions in Motion: Media Archaeology of the Moving Panorama and Related
Spectacles (Leonardo Book Series) are different and dependable to be yours. First of all reading through a
book is good but it really depends in the content of computer which is the content is as delightful as food or
not. Illusions in Motion: Media Archaeology of the Moving Panorama and Related Spectacles (Leonardo
Book Series) giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any publication out there but
there is no guide that similar with Illusions in Motion: Media Archaeology of the Moving Panorama and
Related Spectacles (Leonardo Book Series). It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your current eyes
about the thing this happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. You can actually
bring everywhere like in playground, café, or even in your approach home by train. For anyone who is
having difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form of Illusions in Motion: Media
Archaeology of the Moving Panorama and Related Spectacles (Leonardo Book Series) in e-book can be your
alternative.

Graciela Johnson:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the concept Illusions in Motion:
Media Archaeology of the Moving Panorama and Related Spectacles (Leonardo Book Series) suitable to
you? The particular book was written by famous writer in this era. The book untitled Illusions in Motion:
Media Archaeology of the Moving Panorama and Related Spectacles (Leonardo Book Series)is a single of
several books that will everyone read now. This book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you
read this publication you will enter the new dimension that you ever know ahead of. The author explained
their idea in the simple way, so all of people can easily to recognise the core of this book. This book will
give you a large amount of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world in
this book.

Anna Bailey:

This Illusions in Motion: Media Archaeology of the Moving Panorama and Related Spectacles (Leonardo
Book Series) is great book for you because the content which is full of information for you who always deal
with world and get to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal it details accurately using great
plan word or we can claim no rambling sentences included. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have
whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but challenging core
information with splendid delivering sentences. Having Illusions in Motion: Media Archaeology of the
Moving Panorama and Related Spectacles (Leonardo Book Series) in your hand like getting the world in
your arm, information in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no reserve that offer you world within
ten or fifteen tiny right but this e-book already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hello Mr. and
Mrs. busy do you still doubt which?



Bradley Roberts:

The book untitled Illusions in Motion: Media Archaeology of the Moving Panorama and Related Spectacles
(Leonardo Book Series) contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains the woman idea with
easy technique. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read
the idea. The book was compiled by famous author. The author gives you in the new period of time of
literary works. You can read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or model, so you can
read the book within anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open up their official
web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice go through.
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