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It’s the turn of the twentieth century and drifter Hugh Brennan is a man well acquainted with betrayal. Hugh
finds himself drawn to the attractive widow, Julia, yet when he looks into her eyes, he recognizes the same
hurt that haunts him.

 

Julia Grace has little reason to trust men, but she’s going to have to trust someone if she’s to keep her ranch
from the clutches of her dead husband’s half-brother. Is it possible God had a hand in bringing Hugh to her
door?

 

The latest historical romance from award-winning author Robin Lee Hatcher and the second book in the
Where the Heart Lives series, Betrayal will take you to the high desert of western Wyoming, through the
crags of the Rocky Mountains, and into the hearts of two seekers learning to trust God’s love no matter the
circumstances.
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From reader reviews:

Johnnie Gonzales:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave,
like looking for your favorite guide and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Betrayal: A Novel (Where The Heart Lives Book 2). Try to
make book Betrayal: A Novel (Where The Heart Lives Book 2) as your good friend. It means that it can to
become your friend when you experience alone and beside those of course make you smarter than ever
before. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you considerably more confidence
because you can know almost everything by the book. So , we need to make new experience in addition to
knowledge with this book.

Thomas Hawkins:

The book Betrayal: A Novel (Where The Heart Lives Book 2) gives you the sense of being enjoy for your
spare time. You can use to make your capable more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you
getting tension or having big problem with your subject. If you can make examining a book Betrayal: A
Novel (Where The Heart Lives Book 2) for being your habit, you can get much more advantages, like add
your personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You could know everything if
you like open up and read a publication Betrayal: A Novel (Where The Heart Lives Book 2). Kinds of book
are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this
guide?

George Conner:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Betrayal: A Novel (Where The Heart
Lives Book 2) e-book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that could be
understand by anyone who all read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping every ideas
and composing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still doubt Betrayal: A Novel (Where
The Heart Lives Book 2) as good book but not only by the cover but also through the content. This is one
book that can break don't ascertain book by its cover, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this
specific!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to another
sixth sense.

Lisa Loo:

This Betrayal: A Novel (Where The Heart Lives Book 2) is great reserve for you because the content which
is full of information for you who have always deal with world and have to make decision every minute.
That book reveal it facts accurately using great organize word or we can point out no rambling sentences
included. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only
provides straight forward sentences but tricky core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having



Betrayal: A Novel (Where The Heart Lives Book 2) in your hand like finding the world in your arm,
information in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no guide that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen
tiny right but this e-book already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you
still doubt that?
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